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Merchandise and producers of the 
Subject Merchandise in the Subject 
Country that currently export or have 
exported Subject Merchandise to the 
United States or other countries since 
the Order Date. 

(7) A list of 3–5 leading purchasers in 
the U.S. market for the Domestic Like 
Product and the Subject Merchandise 
(including street address, World Wide 
Web address, and the name, telephone 
number, fax number, and Email address 
of a responsible official at each firm). 

(8) A list of known sources of 
information on national or regional 
prices for the Domestic Like Product or 
the Subject Merchandise in the U.S. or 
other markets. 

(9) If you are a U.S. producer of the 
Domestic Like Product, provide the 
following information on your firm’s 
operations on that product during 
calendar year 2023, except as noted 
(report quantity data in units and value 
data in U.S. dollars, f.o.b. plant). If you 
are a union/worker group or trade/ 
business association, provide the 
information, on an aggregate basis, for 
the firms in which your workers are 
employed/which are members of your 
association. 

(a) Production (quantity) and, if 
known, an estimate of the percentage of 
total U.S. production of the Domestic 
Like Product accounted for by your 
firm’s(s’) production; 

(b) Capacity (quantity) of your firm to 
produce the Domestic Like Product (that 
is, the level of production that your 
establishment(s) could reasonably have 
expected to attain during the year, 
assuming normal operating conditions 
(using equipment and machinery in 
place and ready to operate), normal 
operating levels (hours per week/weeks 
per year), time for downtime, 
maintenance, repair, and cleanup, and a 
typical or representative product mix); 

(c) the quantity and value of U.S. 
commercial shipments of the Domestic 
Like Product produced in your U.S. 
plant(s); 

(d) the quantity and value of U.S. 
internal consumption/company 
transfers of the Domestic Like Product 
produced in your U.S. plant(s); and 

(e) the value of (i) net sales, (ii) cost 
of goods sold (COGS), (iii) gross profit, 
(iv) selling, general and administrative 
(SG&A) expenses, and (v) operating 
income of the Domestic Like Product 
produced in your U.S. plant(s) (include 
both U.S. and export commercial sales, 
internal consumption, and company 
transfers) for your most recently 
completed fiscal year (identify the date 
on which your fiscal year ends). 

(10) If you are a U.S. importer or a 
trade/business association of U.S. 

importers of the Subject Merchandise 
from the Subject Country, provide the 
following information on your firm’s(s’) 
operations on that product during 
calendar year 2023 (report quantity data 
in units and value data in U.S. dollars). 
If you are a trade/business association, 
provide the information, on an aggregate 
basis, for the firms which are members 
of your association. 

(a) The quantity and value (landed, 
duty-paid but not including 
antidumping or countervailing duties) 
of U.S. imports and, if known, an 
estimate of the percentage of total U.S. 
imports of Subject Merchandise from 
the Subject Country accounted for by 
your firm’s(s’) imports; 

(b) the quantity and value (f.o.b. U.S. 
port, including antidumping and/or 
countervailing duties) of U.S. 
commercial shipments of Subject 
Merchandise imported from the Subject 
Country; and 

(c) the quantity and value (f.o.b. U.S. 
port, including antidumping and/or 
countervailing duties) of U.S. internal 
consumption/company transfers of 
Subject Merchandise imported from the 
Subject Country. 

(11) If you are a producer, an exporter, 
or a trade/business association of 
producers or exporters of the Subject 
Merchandise in the Subject Country, 
provide the following information on 
your firm’s(s’) operations on that 
product during calendar year 2023 
(report quantity data in units and value 
data in U.S. dollars, landed and duty- 
paid at the U.S. port but not including 
antidumping or countervailing duties). 
If you are a trade/business association, 
provide the information, on an aggregate 
basis, for the firms which are members 
of your association. 

(a) Production (quantity) and, if 
known, an estimate of the percentage of 
total production of Subject Merchandise 
in the Subject Country accounted for by 
your firm’s(s’) production; 

(b) Capacity (quantity) of your firm(s) 
to produce the Subject Merchandise in 
the Subject Country (that is, the level of 
production that your establishment(s) 
could reasonably have expected to 
attain during the year, assuming normal 
operating conditions (using equipment 
and machinery in place and ready to 
operate), normal operating levels (hours 
per week/weeks per year), time for 
downtime, maintenance, repair, and 
cleanup, and a typical or representative 
product mix); and 

(c) the quantity and value of your 
firm’s(s’) exports to the United States of 
Subject Merchandise and, if known, an 
estimate of the percentage of total 
exports to the United States of Subject 

Merchandise from the Subject Country 
accounted for by your firm’s(s’) exports. 

(12) Identify significant changes, if 
any, in the supply and demand 
conditions or business cycle for the 
Domestic Like Product that have 
occurred in the United States or in the 
market for the Subject Merchandise in 
the Subject Country since the Order 
Date, and significant changes, if any, 
that are likely to occur within a 
reasonably foreseeable time. Supply 
conditions to consider include 
technology; production methods; 
development efforts; ability to increase 
production (including the shift of 
production facilities used for other 
products and the use, cost, or 
availability of major inputs into 
production); and factors related to the 
ability to shift supply among different 
national markets (including barriers to 
importation in foreign markets or 
changes in market demand abroad). 
Demand conditions to consider include 
end uses and applications; the existence 
and availability of substitute products; 
and the level of competition among the 
Domestic Like Product produced in the 
United States, Subject Merchandise 
produced in the Subject Country, and 
such merchandise from other countries. 

(13) (OPTIONAL) A statement of 
whether you agree with the above 
definitions of the Domestic Like Product 
and Domestic Industry; if you disagree 
with either or both of these definitions, 
please explain why and provide 
alternative definitions. 

Authority: This proceeding is being 
conducted under authority of Title VII 
of the Tariff Act of 1930; this notice is 
published pursuant to § 207.61 of the 
Commission’s rules. 

By order of the Commission. 
Issued: October 24, 2024. 

Lisa Barton, 
Secretary to the Commission. 
[FR Doc. 2024–25109 Filed 10–31–24; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 7020–02–P 

INTERNATIONAL TRADE 
COMMISSION 

[Investigation Nos. 701–TA–618–619 and 
731–TA–1441–1444 (Review)] 

Carbon and Alloy Steel Threaded Rod 
From China, India, Taiwan, and 
Thailand; Institution of Five-Year 
Reviews 

AGENCY: United States International 
Trade Commission. 
ACTION: Notice. 

SUMMARY: The Commission hereby gives 
notice that it has instituted reviews 
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pursuant to the Tariff Act of 1930 (‘‘the 
Act’’), as amended, to determine 
whether revocation of the 
countervailing duty orders on carbon 
and alloy steel threaded rod from China 
and India, and the antidumping duty 
orders on carbon and alloy steel 
threaded rod from China, India, Taiwan, 
and Thailand would be likely to lead to 
continuation or recurrence of material 
injury. Pursuant to the Act, interested 
parties are requested to respond to this 
notice by submitting the information 
specified below to the Commission. 
DATES: Instituted November 1, 2024. To 
be assured of consideration, the 
deadline for responses is December 2, 
2024. Comments on the adequacy of 
responses may be filed with the 
Commission by January 2, 2025. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Jesse Sanchez (202–205–2402), Office of 
Investigations, U.S. International Trade 
Commission, 500 E Street SW, 
Washington, DC 20436. Hearing- 
impaired persons can obtain 
information on this matter by contacting 
the Commission’s TDD terminal on 202– 
205–1810. Persons with mobility 
impairments who will need special 
assistance in gaining access to the 
Commission should contact the Office 
of the Secretary at 202–205–2000. 
General information concerning the 
Commission may also be obtained by 
accessing its internet server (https://
www.usitc.gov). The public record for 
this proceeding may be viewed on the 
Commission’s electronic docket (EDIS) 
at https://edis.usitc.gov. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 

Background.—On December 13, 2019, 
the Department of Commerce 
(‘‘Commerce’’) issued an antidumping 
duty order on imports of carbon and 
alloy steel threaded rod from Thailand 
(84 FR 68108). On February 5, 2020, 
Commerce issued an antidumping duty 
order on imports of carbon and alloy 
steel threaded rod from Taiwan (85 FR 
6511). On April 9, 2020, Commerce 
issued antidumping and countervailing 
duty orders on imports of carbon and 
alloy steel threaded rod from China and 
India (85 FR 19925, 19927, and 19929). 
The Commission is conducting reviews 
pursuant to section 751(c) of the Act, as 
amended (19 U.S.C. 1675(c)), to 
determine whether revocation of the 
orders would be likely to lead to 
continuation or recurrence of material 
injury to the domestic industry within 
a reasonably foreseeable time. 
Provisions concerning the conduct of 
this proceeding may be found in the 
Commission’s Rules of Practice and 
Procedure at 19 CFR part 201, subparts 
A and B, and 19 CFR part 207, subparts 

A and F. The Commission will assess 
the adequacy of interested party 
responses to this notice of institution to 
determine whether to conduct full or 
expedited reviews. The Commission’s 
determinations in any expedited 
reviews will be based on the facts 
available, which may include 
information provided in response to this 
notice. 

Definitions.—The following 
definitions apply to these reviews: 

(1) Subject Merchandise is the class or 
kind of merchandise that is within the 
scope of the five-year reviews, as 
defined by Commerce. 

(2) The Subject Countries in these 
reviews are China, India, Taiwan, and 
Thailand. 

(3) The Domestic Like Product is the 
domestically produced product or 
products which are like, or in the 
absence of like, most similar in 
characteristics and uses with, the 
Subject Merchandise. In its original 
determinations, the Commission 
defined a single Domestic Like Product 
consisting of carbon and alloy steel 
threaded rod, coextensive with 
Commerce’s scope. 

(4) The Domestic Industry is the U.S. 
producers as a whole of the Domestic 
Like Product, or those producers whose 
collective output of the Domestic Like 
Product constitutes a major proportion 
of the total domestic production of the 
product. In its original determinations, 
the Commission defined the Domestic 
Industry to include all U.S. producers of 
carbon and alloy steel threaded rod, 
with the exceptions of certain U.S. 
producers that were excluded from the 
Domestic Industry as related parties. 
One Commissioner defined the 
Domestic Industry differently. 

(5) The Order Dates are the dates that 
the orders under review became 
effective. In the review concerning 
Thailand, the Order Date is December 
13, 2019. In the review concerning 
Taiwan, the Order Date is February 5, 
2020. In the reviews concerning China 
and India, the Order Date is April 9, 
2020. 

(6) An Importer is any person or firm 
engaged, either directly or through a 
parent company or subsidiary, in 
importing the Subject Merchandise into 
the United States from a foreign 
manufacturer or through its selling 
agent. 

Participation in the proceeding and 
public service list.—Persons, including 
industrial users of the Subject 
Merchandise and, if the merchandise is 
sold at the retail level, representative 
consumer organizations, wishing to 
participate in the proceeding as parties 
must file an entry of appearance with 

the Secretary to the Commission, as 
provided in § 201.11(b)(4) of the 
Commission’s rules, no later than 21 
days after publication of this notice in 
the Federal Register. The Secretary will 
maintain a public service list containing 
the names and addresses of all persons, 
or their representatives, who are parties 
to the proceeding. 

Former Commission employees who 
are seeking to appear in Commission 
five-year reviews are advised that they 
may appear in a review even if they 
participated personally and 
substantially in the corresponding 
underlying original investigation or an 
earlier review of the same underlying 
investigation. The Commission’s 
designated agency ethics official has 
advised that a five-year review is not the 
same particular matter as the underlying 
original investigation, and a five-year 
review is not the same particular matter 
as an earlier review of the same 
underlying investigation for purposes of 
18 U.S.C. 207, the post-employment 
statute for Federal employees, and 
Commission rule 201.15(b) (19 CFR 
201.15(b)), 79 FR 3246 (Jan. 17, 2014), 
73 FR 24609 (May 5, 2008). 
Consequently, former employees are not 
required to seek Commission approval 
to appear in a review under Commission 
rule 19 CFR 201.15, even if the 
corresponding underlying original 
investigation or an earlier review of the 
same underlying investigation was 
pending when they were Commission 
employees. For further ethics advice on 
this matter, contact Charles Smith, 
Office of the General Counsel, at 202– 
205–3408. 

Limited disclosure of business 
proprietary information (BPI) under an 
administrative protective order (APO) 
and APO service list.—Pursuant to 
§ 207.7(a) of the Commission’s rules, the 
Secretary will make BPI submitted in 
this proceeding available to authorized 
applicants under the APO issued in the 
proceeding, provided that the 
application is made no later than 21 
days after publication of this notice in 
the Federal Register. Authorized 
applicants must represent interested 
parties, as defined in 19 U.S.C. 1677(9), 
who are parties to the proceeding. A 
separate service list will be maintained 
by the Secretary for those parties 
authorized to receive BPI under the 
APO. 

Certification.—Pursuant to § 207.3 of 
the Commission’s rules, any person 
submitting information to the 
Commission in connection with this 
proceeding must certify that the 
information is accurate and complete to 
the best of the submitter’s knowledge. In 
making the certification, the submitter 
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will acknowledge that information 
submitted in response to this request for 
information and throughout this 
proceeding or other proceeding may be 
disclosed to and used: (i) by the 
Commission, its employees and Offices, 
and contract personnel (a) for 
developing or maintaining the records 
of this or a related proceeding, or (b) in 
internal investigations, audits, reviews, 
and evaluations relating to the 
programs, personnel, and operations of 
the Commission including under 5 
U.S.C. Appendix 3; or (ii) by U.S. 
government employees and contract 
personnel, solely for cybersecurity 
purposes. All contract personnel will 
sign appropriate nondisclosure 
agreements. 

Written submissions.—Pursuant to 
§ 207.61 of the Commission’s rules, each 
interested party response to this notice 
must provide the information specified 
below. The deadline for filing such 
responses is on or before 5:15 p.m. on 
December 2, 2024. Pursuant to 
§ 207.62(b) of the Commission’s rules, 
eligible parties (as specified in 
Commission rule 207.62(b)(1)) may also 
file comments concerning the adequacy 
of responses to the notice of institution 
and whether the Commission should 
conduct expedited or full reviews. The 
deadline for filing such comments is on 
or before 5:15 p.m. on January 2, 2025. 
All written submissions must conform 
with the provisions of § 201.8 of the 
Commission’s rules; any submissions 
that contain BPI must also conform with 
the requirements of §§ 201.6, 207.3, and 
207.7 of the Commission’s rules. The 
Commission’s Handbook on Filing 
Procedures, available on the 
Commission’s website at https://
www.usitc.gov/documents/handbook_
on_filing_procedures.pdf, elaborates 
upon the Commission’s procedures with 
respect to filings. Also, in accordance 
with §§ 201.16(c) and 207.3 of the 
Commission’s rules, each document 
filed by a party to the proceeding must 
be served on all other parties to the 
proceeding (as identified by either the 
public or APO service list as 
appropriate), and a certificate of service 
must accompany the document (if you 
are not a party to the proceeding you do 
not need to serve your response). 

Please note the Secretary’s Office will 
accept only electronic filings at this 
time. Filings must be made through the 
Commission’s Electronic Document 
Information System (EDIS, https://
edis.usitc.gov). No in-person paper- 
based filings or paper copies of any 
electronic filings will be accepted until 
further notice. 

No response to this request for 
information is required if a currently 

valid Office of Management and Budget 
(‘‘OMB’’) number is not displayed; the 
OMB number is 3117 0016/USITC No. 
24–5–621, expiration date June 30, 
2026. Public reporting burden for the 
request is estimated to average 15 hours 
per response. Please send comments 
regarding the accuracy of this burden 
estimate to the Office of Investigations, 
U.S. International Trade Commission, 
500 E Street SW, Washington, DC 
20436. 

Inability to provide requested 
information.—Pursuant to § 207.61(c) of 
the Commission’s rules, any interested 
party that cannot furnish the 
information requested by this notice in 
the requested form and manner shall 
notify the Commission at the earliest 
possible time, provide a full explanation 
of why it cannot provide the requested 
information, and indicate alternative 
forms in which it can provide 
equivalent information. If an interested 
party does not provide this notification 
(or the Commission finds the 
explanation provided in the notification 
inadequate) and fails to provide a 
complete response to this notice, the 
Commission may take an adverse 
inference against the party pursuant to 
§ 776(b) of the Act (19 U.S.C. 1677e(b)) 
in making its determinations in the 
reviews. 

Information To Be Provided in 
Response to This Notice of Institution: If 
you are a domestic producer, union/ 
worker group, or trade/business 
association; import/export Subject 
Merchandise from more than one 
Subject Country; or produce Subject 
Merchandise in more than one Subject 
Country, you may file a single response. 
If you do so, please ensure that your 
response to each question includes the 
information requested for each pertinent 
Subject Country. As used below, the 
term ‘‘firm’’ includes any related firms. 

Those responding to this notice of 
institution are encouraged, but not 
required, to visit the USITC’s website at 
https://usitc.gov/reports/response_noi_
worksheet, where one can download 
and complete the ‘‘NOI worksheet’’ 
Excel form for the subject proceeding, to 
be included as attachment/exhibit 1 of 
your overall response. 

(1) The name and address of your firm 
or entity (including World Wide Web 
address) and name, telephone number, 
fax number, and Email address of the 
certifying official. 

(2) A statement indicating whether 
your firm/entity is an interested party 
under 19 U.S.C. 1677(9) and if so, how, 
including whether your firm/entity is a 
U.S. producer of the Domestic Like 
Product, a U.S. union or worker group, 
a U.S. importer of the Subject 

Merchandise, a foreign producer or 
exporter of the Subject Merchandise, a 
U.S. or foreign trade or business 
association (a majority of whose 
members are interested parties under 
the statute), or another interested party 
(including an explanation). If you are a 
union/worker group or trade/business 
association, identify the firms in which 
your workers are employed or which are 
members of your association. 

(3) A statement indicating whether 
your firm/entity is willing to participate 
in this proceeding by providing 
information requested by the 
Commission. 

(4) A statement of the likely effects of 
the revocation of the orders on the 
Domestic Industry in general and/or 
your firm/entity specifically. In your 
response, please discuss the various 
factors specified in § 752(a) of the Act 
(19 U.S.C. 1675a(a)) including the likely 
volume of subject imports, likely price 
effects of subject imports, and likely 
impact of imports of Subject 
Merchandise on the Domestic Industry. 

(5) A list of all known and currently 
operating U.S. producers of the 
Domestic Like Product. Identify any 
known related parties and the nature of 
the relationship as defined in 
§ 771(4)(B) of the Act (19 U.S.C. 
1677(4)(B)). 

(6) A list of all known and currently 
operating U.S. importers of the Subject 
Merchandise and producers of the 
Subject Merchandise in each Subject 
Country that currently export or have 
exported Subject Merchandise to the 
United States or other countries since 
each Order Date. 

(7) A list of 3–5 leading purchasers in 
the U.S. market for the Domestic Like 
Product and the Subject Merchandise 
(including street address, World Wide 
Web address, and the name, telephone 
number, fax number, and Email address 
of a responsible official at each firm). 

(8) A list of known sources of 
information on national or regional 
prices for the Domestic Like Product or 
the Subject Merchandise in the U.S. or 
other markets. 

(9) If you are a U.S. producer of the 
Domestic Like Product, provide the 
following information on your firm’s 
operations on that product during 
calendar year 2023, except as noted 
(report quantity data in pounds and 
value data in U.S. dollars, f.o.b. plant). 
If you are a union/worker group or 
trade/business association, provide the 
information, on an aggregate basis, for 
the firms in which your workers are 
employed/which are members of your 
association. 

(a) Production (quantity) and, if 
known, an estimate of the percentage of 
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1 The record is defined in § 207.2(f) of the 
Commission’s Rules of Practice and Procedure (19 
CFR 207.2(f)). 

2 Commissioner David S. Johanson dissenting 
with respect to the order on silicomanganese from 
Ukraine. 

total U.S. production of the Domestic 
Like Product accounted for by your 
firm’s(s’) production; 

(b) Capacity (quantity) of your firm to 
produce the Domestic Like Product (that 
is, the level of production that your 
establishment(s) could reasonably have 
expected to attain during the year, 
assuming normal operating conditions 
(using equipment and machinery in 
place and ready to operate), normal 
operating levels (hours per week/weeks 
per year), time for downtime, 
maintenance, repair, and cleanup, and a 
typical or representative product mix); 

(c) the quantity and value of U.S. 
commercial shipments of the Domestic 
Like Product produced in your U.S. 
plant(s); 

(d) the quantity and value of U.S. 
internal consumption/company 
transfers of the Domestic Like Product 
produced in your U.S. plant(s); and 

(e) the value of (i) net sales, (ii) cost 
of goods sold (COGS), (iii) gross profit, 
(iv) selling, general and administrative 
(SG&A) expenses, and (v) operating 
income of the Domestic Like Product 
produced in your U.S. plant(s) (include 
both U.S. and export commercial sales, 
internal consumption, and company 
transfers) for your most recently 
completed fiscal year (identify the date 
on which your fiscal year ends). 

(10) If you are a U.S. importer or a 
trade/business association of U.S. 
importers of the Subject Merchandise 
from any Subject Country, provide the 
following information on your firm’s(s’) 
operations on that product during 
calendar year 2023 (report quantity data 
in pounds and value data in U.S. 
dollars). If you are a trade/business 
association, provide the information, on 
an aggregate basis, for the firms which 
are members of your association. 

(a) The quantity and value (landed, 
duty-paid but not including 
antidumping or countervailing duties) 
of U.S. imports and, if known, an 
estimate of the percentage of total U.S. 
imports of Subject Merchandise from 
each Subject Country accounted for by 
your firm’s(s’) imports; 

(b) the quantity and value (f.o.b. U.S. 
port, including antidumping and/or 
countervailing duties) of U.S. 
commercial shipments of Subject 
Merchandise imported from each 
Subject Country; and 

(c) the quantity and value (f.o.b. U.S. 
port, including antidumping and/or 
countervailing duties) of U.S. internal 
consumption/company transfers of 
Subject Merchandise imported from 
each Subject Country. 

(11) If you are a producer, an exporter, 
or a trade/business association of 
producers or exporters of the Subject 

Merchandise in any Subject Country, 
provide the following information on 
your firm’s(s’) operations on that 
product during calendar year 2023 
(report quantity data in pounds and 
value data in U.S. dollars, landed and 
duty-paid at the U.S. port but not 
including antidumping or 
countervailing duties). If you are a 
trade/business association, provide the 
information, on an aggregate basis, for 
the firms which are members of your 
association. 

(a) Production (quantity) and, if 
known, an estimate of the percentage of 
total production of Subject Merchandise 
in each Subject Country accounted for 
by your firm’s(s’) production; 

(b) Capacity (quantity) of your firm(s) 
to produce the Subject Merchandise in 
each Subject Country (that is, the level 
of production that your establishment(s) 
could reasonably have expected to 
attain during the year, assuming normal 
operating conditions (using equipment 
and machinery in place and ready to 
operate), normal operating levels (hours 
per week/weeks per year), time for 
downtime, maintenance, repair, and 
cleanup, and a typical or representative 
product mix); and 

(c) the quantity and value of your 
firm’s(s’) exports to the United States of 
Subject Merchandise and, if known, an 
estimate of the percentage of total 
exports to the United States of Subject 
Merchandise from each Subject Country 
accounted for by your firm’s(s’) exports. 

(12) Identify significant changes, if 
any, in the supply and demand 
conditions or business cycle for the 
Domestic Like Product that have 
occurred in the United States or in the 
market for the Subject Merchandise in 
each Subject Country since each Order 
Date, and significant changes, if any, 
that are likely to occur within a 
reasonably foreseeable time. Supply 
conditions to consider include 
technology; production methods; 
development efforts; ability to increase 
production (including the shift of 
production facilities used for other 
products and the use, cost, or 
availability of major inputs into 
production); and factors related to the 
ability to shift supply among different 
national markets (including barriers to 
importation in foreign markets or 
changes in market demand abroad). 
Demand conditions to consider include 
end uses and applications; the existence 
and availability of substitute products; 
and the level of competition among the 
Domestic Like Product produced in the 
United States, Subject Merchandise 
produced in each Subject Country, and 
such merchandise from other countries. 

(13) (OPTIONAL) A statement of 
whether you agree with the above 
definitions of the Domestic Like Product 
and Domestic Industry; if you disagree 
with either or both of these definitions, 
please explain why and provide 
alternative definitions. 

Authority: This proceeding is being 
conducted under authority of Title VII 
of the Tariff Act of 1930; this notice is 
published pursuant to § 207.61 of the 
Commission’s rules. 

By order of the Commission. 
Issued: October 24, 2024. 

Lisa Barton, 
Secretary to the Commission. 
[FR Doc. 2024–25100 Filed 10–31–24; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 7020–02–P 

INTERNATIONAL TRADE 
COMMISSION 

[Investigation Nos. 731–TA–672–673 (Fifth 
Review)] 

Silicomanganese From China and 
Ukraine 

Determinations 
On the basis of the record 1 developed 

in the subject five-year reviews, the 
United States International Trade 
Commission (‘‘Commission’’) 
determines, pursuant to the Tariff Act of 
1930 (‘‘the Act’’), that revocation of the 
antidumping duty orders on 
silicomanganese from China and 
Ukraine would be likely to lead to 
continuation or recurrence of material 
injury to an industry in the United 
States within a reasonably foreseeable 
time.2 

Background 
The Commission instituted these 

reviews on November 1, 2023 (88 FR 
75029) and determined on February 5, 
2024, that it would conduct full reviews 
(89 FR 13375, February 22, 2024). 
Notice of the scheduling of the 
Commission’s reviews and of a public 
hearing to be held in connection 
therewith was given by posting copies 
of the notice in the Office of the 
Secretary, U.S. International Trade 
Commission, Washington, DC, and by 
publishing the notice in the Federal 
Register on May 1, 2024 (89 FR 35240). 
The Commission conducted its hearing 
on September 5, 2024. All persons who 
requested the opportunity were 
permitted to participate. 
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1 See Aluminum Extrusions from Indonesia: Final 
Affirmative Determination of Sales at Less Than 
Fair Value, 89 FR 80487 (October 3, 2024) (Final 
Determination). 

2 See Aluminum Extrusions from Indonesia: 
Preliminary Affirmative Countervailing Duty 
Determination and Alignment of Final 
Determination With the Final Antidumping Duty 
Determination, 89 FR 17405 (March 11, 2024); see 
also section 703(d) of the Act, which states that the 

provisional measures may not be in effect for more 
than four months, which in the companion CVD 
case is 120 days after the publication of the 
preliminary determination, or July 8, 2024 (i.e., last 
day provisional measures are in effect). 

A copy of the notification will be 
available for public inspection in the 
‘‘Online FTZ Information System’’ 
section of the Board’s website. 

For further information, contact Diane 
Finver at Diane.Finver@trade.gov. 

Dated: October 30, 2024. 
Elizabeth Whiteman, 
Executive Secretary. 
[FR Doc. 2024–25580 Filed 11–1–24; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 3510–DS–P 

DEPARTMENT OF COMMERCE 

International Trade Administration 

[A–560–840] 

Aluminum Extrusions From Indonesia: 
Final Affirmative Determination of 
Sales at Less Than Fair Value; 
Correction 

AGENCY: Enforcement and Compliance, 
International Trade Administration, 
Department of Commerce. 

ACTION: Notice; correction. 

SUMMARY: The U.S. Department of 
Commerce (Commerce) published 
notice in the Federal Register of 
October 3, 2024 in which Commerce 
announced the final determination of 
the less-than-fair-value (LTFV) 
investigation of aluminum extrusions 
from Indonesia for the period of 
investigation (POI), October 1, 2022, 
through September 30, 2023. This notice 
corrects the language in the 
‘‘Continuation of Suspension of 
Liquidation’’ section of the Final 
Determination. 

FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Samuel Brummitt, AD/CVD Operations, 
Office III, Enforcement and Compliance, 
International Trade Administration, 
U.S. Department of Commerce, 1401 
Constitution Avenue NW, Washington, 
DC 20230; telephone: (202) 482–7851. 

SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 

Background 

On October 3, 2024, Commerce 
published in the Federal Register the 
final determination of the LTFV 
investigation of aluminum extrusions 
from Indonesia investigation.1 In that 
notice, we failed to include language 
regarding the suspension of liquidation 
of provisional measures in the 
companion countervailing duty (CVD) 
case in the ‘‘Continuation of Suspension 
of Liquidation’’ section. 

Correction 

In the Federal Register of October 3, 
2024, in FR Doc 2024–22780, on page 
80489, in the first column, add the 
following sentence at the end of the 
‘‘Continuation of Suspension of 
Liquidation’’ section: ‘‘However, 
suspension of liquidation of provisional 
measures in the companion CVD case 
has been discontinued; 2 therefore, we 
are not instructing CBP to collect cash 
deposits based upon the adjusted 
estimated weighted-average dumping 
margin for those export subsidies at this 
time.’’ 

Notification to Interested Parties 

This notice is issued and published in 
accordance with sections 735(d) and 
777(i) of the Tariff Act of 1930, as 
amended, and 19 CFR 351.210(c). 

Dated: October 29, 2024. 
Abdelali Elouaradia, 
Deputy Assistant Secretary for Enforcement 
and Compliance. 
[FR Doc. 2024–25581 Filed 11–1–24; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 3510–DS–P 

DEPARTMENT OF COMMERCE 

International Trade Administration 

Initiation of Five-Year (Sunset) 
Reviews 

AGENCY: Enforcement and Compliance, 
International Trade Administration, 
Department of Commerce. 

SUMMARY: In accordance with the Tariff 
Act of 1930, as amended (the Act), the 
U.S. Department of Commerce 
(Commerce) is automatically initiating 
the five-year reviews (Sunset Reviews) 
of the antidumping and countervailing 
duty (AD/CVD) order(s) and suspended 
investigation(s) listed below. The U.S. 
International Trade Commission (ITC) 
will publish notice of Institution of Five- 
Year Reviews which covers the same 
order(s) and suspended investigation(s). 
DATES: Applicable November 4, 2024. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Commerce official identified in the 
Initiation of Review section below at 
AD/CVD Operations, Enforcement and 
Compliance, International Trade 
Administration, U.S. Department of 
Commerce, 1401 Constitution Avenue 
NW, Washington, DC 20230. For 
information from the ITC, contact Mary 
Messer, Office of Investigations, U.S. 
International Trade Commission at (202) 
205–3193. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 

Background 

Commerce’s procedures for the 
conduct of Sunset Reviews are set forth 
in its Procedures for Conducting Five- 
Year (Sunset) Reviews of Antidumping 
and Countervailing Duty Orders, 63 FR 
13516 (March 20, 1998) and 70 FR 
62061 (October 28, 2005). Guidance on 
methodological or analytical issues 
relevant to Commerce’s conduct of 
Sunset Reviews is set forth in 
Antidumping Proceedings: Calculation 
of the Weighted-Average Dumping 
Margin and Assessment Rate in Certain 
Antidumping Duty Proceedings; Final 
Modification, 77 FR 8101 (February 14, 
2012). 

Initiation of Review 

In accordance with section 751(c) of 
the Act and 19 CFR 351.218(c), we are 
initiating the Sunset Reviews of the 
following antidumping and 
countervailing duty order(s) and 
suspended investigation(s): 

DOC case No. ITC case No. Country Product Commerce contact 

A–423–814 ...... 731–TA–1435 Belgium ............ Acetone (1st Review) ................................... Jacqueline Arrowsmith, (202) 482–5255. 
A–580–899 ...... 731–TA–1436 Korea ................ Acetone (1st Review) ................................... Jacqueline Arrowsmith, (202) 482–5255. 
A–559–808 ...... 731–TA–1438 Singapore ......... Acetone (1st Review) ................................... Jacqueline Arrowsmith, (202) 482–5255. 
A–791–824 ...... 731–TA–1439 South Africa ...... Acetone (1st Review) ................................... Jacqueline Arrowsmith, (202) 482–5255. 
A–469–819 ...... 731–TA–1440 Spain ................ Acetone (1st Review) ................................... Jacqueline Arrowsmith, (202) 482–5255. 
A–570–095 ...... 731–TA–1428 China ................ Aluminum Wire and Cable (1st Review) ..... Jacqueline Arrowsmith, (202) 482–5255. 
A–570–104 ...... 731–TA–1441 China ................ Carbon and Alloy Steel Threaded Rod (1st 

Review).
Mary Kolberg, (202) 482–1785. 
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1 See Temporary Rule Modifying AD/CVD Service 
Requirements Due to COVID–19, 85 FR 41363 (July 
10, 2020). 2 See 19 CFR 351.218(d)(1)(iii). 

DOC case No. ITC case No. Country Product Commerce contact 

A–533–887 ...... 731–TA–1442 India .................. Carbon and Alloy Steel Threaded Rod (1st 
Review).

Mary Kolberg, (202) 482–1785. 

A–583–865 ...... 731–TA–1443 Taiwan .............. Carbon and Alloy Steel Threaded Rod (1st 
Review).

Mary Kolberg, (202) 482–1785. 

A–549–840 ...... 731–TA–1444 Thailand ............ Carbon and Alloy Steel Threaded Rod (1st 
Review).

Mary Kolberg, (202) 482–1785. 

A–570–881 ...... 731–TA–1021 China ................ Malleable Iron Pipe Fittings (4th Review) .... Mary Kolberg, (202) 482–1785. 
A–570–092 ...... 731–TA–1424 China ................ Mattresses (1st Review) .............................. Thomas Martin, (202) 482–3936. 
A–570–909 ...... 731–TA–1114 China ................ Steel Nails (3rd Review) .............................. Mary Kolberg, (202) 482–1785. 
A–570–110 ...... 731–TA–1449 China ................ Vertical Metal File Cabinets (1st Review) ... Jacqueline Arrowsmith, (202) 482–5255. 
A–570–930 ...... 731–TA–1144 China ................ Welded Stainless Steel Pressure Pipe (3rd 

Review).
Thomas Martin, (202) 482–3936. 

A–557–815 ...... 731–TA–1210 Malaysia ........... Welded Stainless Steel Pressure Pipe (2nd 
Review).

Thomas Martin, (202) 482–3936. 

A–549–830 ...... 731–TA–1211 Thailand ............ Welded Stainless Steel Pressure Pipe (2nd 
Review).

Thomas Martin, (202) 482–3936. 

A–552–816 ...... 731–TA–1212 Vietnam ............ Welded Stainless Steel Pressure Pipe (2nd 
Review).

Thomas Martin, (202) 482–3936. 

C–570–096 ...... 701–TA–611 China ................ Aluminum Wire and Cable (1st Review) ..... Jacqueline Arrowsmith, (202) 482–5255. 
C–570–105 ...... 701–TA–618 China ................ Carbon and Alloy Steel Threaded Rod (1st 

Review).
Mary Kolberg, (202) 482–1785. 

C–533–888 ...... 701–TA–619 India .................. Carbon and Alloy Steel Threaded Rod (1st 
Review).

Mary Kolberg, (202) 482–1785. 

C–570–111 ...... 701–TA–623 China ................ Vertical Metal File Cabinets (1st Review) ... Jacqueline Arrowsmith, (202) 482–5255. 
C–570–931 ...... 701–TA–454 China ................ Welded Stainless Steel Pressure Pipe (3rd 

Review).
Mary Kolberg, (202) 482–1785. 

Filing Information 

As a courtesy, we are making 
information related to sunset 
proceedings, including copies of the 
pertinent statute and Commerce’s 
regulations, Commerce’s schedule for 
Sunset Reviews, a listing of past 
revocations and continuations, and 
current service lists, available to the 
public on Commerce’s website at the 
following address: https://enforcement.
trade.gov/sunset/. All submissions in 
these Sunset Reviews must be filed in 
accordance with Commerce’s 
regulations regarding format, 
translation, and service of documents. 
These rules, including electronic filing 
requirements via Enforcement and 
Compliance’s Antidumping and 
Countervailing Duty Centralized 
Electronic Service System (ACCESS), 
can be found at 19 CFR 351.303. 

In accordance with section 782(b) of 
the Act, any party submitting factual 
information in an AD/CVD proceeding 
must certify to the accuracy and 
completeness of that information. 
Parties must use the certification 
formats provided in 19 CFR 351.303(g). 
Commerce intends to reject factual 
submissions if the submitting party does 
not comply with applicable revised 
certification requirements. 

Letters of Appearance and 
Administrative Protective Orders 

Pursuant to 19 CFR 351.103(d), 
Commerce will maintain and make 
available a public service list for these 
proceedings. Parties wishing to 

participate in any of these five-year 
reviews must file letters of appearance 
as discussed at 19 CFR 351.103(d). To 
facilitate the timely preparation of the 
public service list, it is requested that 
those seeking recognition as interested 
parties to a proceeding submit an entry 
of appearance within 10 days of the 
publication of the Notice of Initiation. 
Because deadlines in Sunset Reviews 
can be very short, we urge interested 
parties who want access to proprietary 
information under administrative 
protective order (APO) to file an APO 
application immediately following 
publication in the Federal Register of 
this notice of initiation. Commerce’s 
regulations on submission of proprietary 
information and eligibility to receive 
access to business proprietary 
information under APO can be found at 
19 CFR 351.304 through 351.306. Note 
that Commerce has temporarily 
modified certain of its requirements for 
serving documents containing business 
proprietary information, until further 
notice.1 

Information Required From Interested 
Parties 

Domestic interested parties, as 
defined in section 771(9)(C), (D), (E), (F), 
and (G) of the Act and 19 CFR 
351.102(b), wishing to participate in a 
Sunset Review must respond not later 
than 15 days after the date of 
publication in the Federal Register of 

this notice of initiation by filing a notice 
of intent to participate. The required 
contents of the notice of intent to 
participate are set forth at 19 CFR 
351.218(d)(1)(ii). In accordance with 
Commerce’s regulations, if we do not 
receive a notice of intent to participate 
from at least one domestic interested 
party by the 15-day deadline, Commerce 
will automatically revoke the order 
without further review.2 

If we receive an order-specific notice 
of intent to participate from a domestic 
interested party, Commerce’s 
regulations provide that all parties 
wishing to participate in a Sunset 
Review must file complete substantive 
responses not later than 30 days after 
the date of publication in the Federal 
Register of this notice of initiation. The 
required contents of a substantive 
response, on an order-specific basis, are 
set forth at 19 CFR 351.218(d)(3). Note 
that certain information requirements 
differ for respondent and domestic 
parties. Also, note that Commerce’s 
information requirements are distinct 
from the ITC ’s information 
requirements. Consult Commerce’s 
regulations for information regarding 
Commerce’s conduct of Sunset Reviews. 
Consult Commerce’s regulations at 19 
CFR part 351 for definitions of terms 
and for other general information 
concerning antidumping and 
countervailing duty proceedings at 
Commerce. 

Note that Commerce has amended 
certain of its requirements pertaining to 
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3 See Administrative Protective Order, Service, 
and Other Procedures in Antidumping and 
Countervailing Duty Proceedings; Final Rule, 88 FR 
67069 (September 29, 2023). 

1 See Petitioner’s Letter, ‘‘Petitions for the 
Imposition of Antidumping and Countervailing 
Duties,’’ dated September 30, 2024 (Petitions). 

2 Id. 
3 See Commerce’s Letters, ‘‘Supplemental 

Questions,’’ dated October 2, 2024 (First General 
Issues Questionnaire); see also Country-Specific AD 
Supplemental Questionnaires: China Supplemental, 
Germany Supplemental, India Supplemental, and 
Saudi Arabia Supplemental, dated October 3, 2024; 
Commerce’s Letter, ‘‘Second Supplemental 
Questions,’’ dated October 11, 2024 (Second 
General Issues Questionnaire); Country-Specific 
Second AD Supplemental Questionnaires: China 
Second Supplemental, India Second Supplemental, 
and Saudi Arabia Second Supplemental; and 
Memorandum, ‘‘Phone Call,’’ dated October 15, 
2024 (October 15, 2024, Memorandum). 

4 See Petitioner’s Letters, ‘‘Response to 
Supplemental Questions,’’ dated October 7, 2024 
(First General Issues Supplement); see also 
Country-Specific AD Supplemental Responses: 
China AD Supplement, Germany AD Supplement, 
India AD Supplement, and Saudi Arabia AD 
Supplement, dated October 8, 2024; Petitioners’ 
Letters, ‘‘Petitioner’s Response to Second 
Supplemental Questions,’’ dated October 16, 2024 
(Second General Issues Supplement); Country- 
Specific Second AD Supplemental Responses: 
Second China AD Supplement, Second India AD 
Supplement, and Second Saudi Arabia AD 
Supplement, dated October 16, 2024; and 
Petitioner’s Letter, ‘‘Erratum to Response to 
Supplemental Questions,’’ dated October 18, 2024 
(Second General Issues Errata). 

5 See section on ‘‘Determination of Industry 
Support for the Petitions,’’ infra. 

6 See First General Issues Questionnaire; see also 
Second General Issues Questionnaire; and October 
15, 2024, Memorandum. 

7 See First General Issues Supplement at 3–5; see 
also Second General Issues Supplement at 1–3 and 
Second General Issues Errata. 

8 See Antidumping Duties; Countervailing Duties, 
Final Rule, 62 FR 27296, 27323 (May 19, 1997) 
(Preamble); see also 19 CFR 351.312. 

the service of documents in 19 CFR 
351.303(f).3 An electronically filed 
document must be received successfully 
in its entirety by ACCESS by 5 p.m. 
Eastern Time on the day on which it is 
due. 

In prior proceedings we have 
encouraged interested parties to provide 
an executive summary of their 
comments, including footnotes. In these 
sunset reviews, we request that 
interested parties provide at the 
beginning of their comments, an 
executive summary for each issue raised 
in their comments. Further, we request 
that interested parties limit their public 
executive summary of each issue to no 
more than 450 words, not including 
citations. We intend to use the public 
executive summaries as the basis of the 
comment summaries included in the 
decision memorandum that will 
accompany the notice to be published in 
the Federal Register. Finally, we request 
that interested parties include footnotes 
for relevant citations in the public 
executive summary of each issue. 

This notice of initiation is being 
published in accordance with section 
751(c) of the Act and 19 CFR 351.218(c). 

Dated: October 21, 2024. 
Scot Fullerton, 
Acting Deputy Assistant Secretary for 
Antidumping and Countervailing Duty 
Operations. 
[FR Doc. 2024–25610 Filed 11–1–24; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 3510–DS–P 

DEPARTMENT OF COMMERCE 

International Trade Administration 

[A–570–180, A–428–854, A–533–932, A–517– 
807] 

Hexamethylenetetramine From the 
People’s Republic of China, Germany, 
India, and Saudi Arabia: Initiation of 
Less-Than-Fair-Value Investigations 

AGENCY: Enforcement and Compliance, 
International Trade Administration, 
Department of Commerce. 
DATES: Applicable October 21, 2024. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Thomas Cloyd at 202–482–1246 (the 
People’s Republic of China (China)), 
Ajay Menon at 202–482–0208 
(Germany), Dakota Potts at 202–482– 
0223 (India), and Andrew Hat at 202– 
482–1058 (Saudi Arabia), AD/CVD 
Operations, Enforcement and 
Compliance, International Trade 
Administration, U.S. Department of 

Commerce, 1401 Constitution Avenue 
NW, Washington, DC 20230. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 

The Petitions 
On September 30, 2024, the U.S. 

Department of Commerce (Commerce) 
received antidumping duty (AD) 
petitions concerning imports of 
hexamethylenetetramine (hexamine) 
from China, Germany, India, and Saudi 
Arabia filed in proper form on behalf of 
Bakelite LLC (the petitioner).1 The AD 
Petitions were accompanied by 
countervailing duty (CVD) petitions 
concerning imports of hexamine from 
China and India.2 

Between October 2 and 11, 2024, 
Commerce requested supplemental 
information pertaining to certain aspects 
of the Petitions in supplemental 
questionnaires.3 The petitioner 
responded to Commerce’s supplemental 
questionnaires between October 7 and 
18, 2024.4 

In accordance with section 732(b) of 
the Tariff Act of 1930, as amended (the 
Act), the petitioner alleges that imports 
of hexamine from China, Germany, 
India, and Saudi Arabia are being, or are 
likely to be, sold in the United States at 
less than fair value (LTFV) within the 
meaning of section 731 of the Act, and 
that imports of such products are 
materially injuring, or threatening 
material injury to, the hexamine 
industry in the United States. Consistent 
with section 732(b)(1) of the Act, the 
Petitions were accompanied by 

information reasonably available to the 
petitioner supporting its allegations. 

Commerce finds that the petitioner 
filed the Petitions on behalf of the 
domestic industry, because the 
petitioner is an interested party, as 
defined in section 771(9)(C) of the Act. 
Commerce also finds that the petitioner 
demonstrated sufficient industry 
support for the initiation of the 
requested LTFV investigations.5 

Periods of Investigation 
Because the Petitions were filed on 

September 30, 2024, pursuant to 19 CFR 
351.204(b)(1), the period of 
investigation (POI) for the Germany, 
India, and Saudi Arabia LTFV 
investigations is July 1, 2023, through 
June 30, 2024. Because China is a non- 
market economy (NME) country, 
pursuant to 19 CFR 351.204(b)(1), the 
POI for the China LTFV investigation is 
January 1, 2024, through June 30, 2024. 

Scope of the Investigations 
The product covered by these 

investigations is hexamine from China, 
Germany, India, and Saudi Arabia. For 
a full description of the scope of these 
investigations, see the appendix to this 
notice. 

Comments on the Scope of the 
Investigations 

On October 2 and 11, 2024, 
Commerce requested information and 
clarification from the petitioner 
regarding the proposed scope to ensure 
that the scope language in the Petitions 
is an accurate reflection of the products 
for which the domestic industry is 
seeking relief.6 On October 7 and 18, 
2024, the petitioner provided 
clarifications and revised the scope.7 
The description of merchandise covered 
by these investigations, as described in 
the appendix to this notice, reflects 
these clarifications. 

As discussed in the Preamble to 
Commerce’s regulations, we are setting 
aside a period for interested parties to 
raise issues regarding product coverage 
(i.e., scope).8 Commerce will consider 
all scope comments received from 
interested parties and, if necessary, will 
consult with interested parties prior to 
the issuance of the preliminary 
determinations. If scope comments 
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BILLING CODE:  3510-DS-P  
 
DEPARTMENT OF COMMERCE 
 
International Trade Administration 
 
[A-533-887, A-583-865, A-549-840] 
 
Carbon and Alloy Steel Threaded Rod from India, Taiwan, and Thailand:  Final Results of the 
Expedited First Sunset Reviews of the Antidumping Duty Orders 
  
AGENCY:    Enforcement and Compliance, International Trade Administration, Department of 

Commerce. 
  
SUMMARY:   As a result of these expedited sunset reviews, the U.S. Department of Commerce 

(Commerce) finds that revocation of the antidumping duty (AD) orders on expedited carbon and 

alloy steel threaded rod (steel threaded rod) from the India, Taiwan, and Thailand would be likely 

to lead to the continuation or recurrence of dumping at the levels indicated in the “Final Results 

of Sunset Reviews” section of this notice.  

DATES:  Applicable [Insert date of publication in the Federal Register].  

FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT:  Ashlyn Holeyfield, Trade Agreements Policy 

and Negotiations, Enforcement and Compliance, International Trade Administration, U.S. 

Department of Commerce, 1401 Constitution Avenue, NW, Washington, DC 20230; telephone:  

(202) 482-0017. 

SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION:  

Background  

On December 13, 2019, Commerce published in the Federal Register the AD order on 

steel threaded rod from Thailand, and subsequently published AD orders for steel threaded rod 

from Taiwan on February 5, 2020, and from India on April 9, 2020.1  On November 4, 2024, 

 
1 See Carbon and Alloy Steel Threaded Rod From Thailand:  Antidumping Duty Order, 84 FR 68108 (December 13, 
2019); see also Carbon and Alloy Steel Threaded Rod From Taiwan:  Antidumping Duty Order, 85 FR 6511 



 

2 

Commerce published the Initiation Notice of the first sunset reviews of the Orders, pursuant to 

section 751(c)(2) of the Tariff Act of 1930, as amended (the Act).2  On November 19, 2024, 

Commerce received notices of intent to participate in these reviews from Vulcan Threaded 

Products Inc. (the domestic interested party) within the deadline specified in 19 CFR 

351.218(d)(1)(i).3  The domestic interested party claimed interested party status under section 

771(9)(C) of the Act as a producer of the domestic like product in the United States.4  On 

November 25, 2024 Commerce notified the U.S. International Trade Commission (ITC) that it 

received notices of intent to participate from the domestic interested party.5 

On December 2, 2024, Commerce received adequate substantive responses from the 

domestic interested party.6  We received no substantive responses from respondent interested 

parties.  On December 26, 2024, Commerce notified the ITC that it did not receive substantive 

responses from any respondent interested parties.7  As a result, pursuant to section 751(c)(3)(B) 

of the Act and 19 CFR 351.218(e)(1)(ii)(C)(2), Commerce conducted expedited (120-day) sunset 

reviews of the Orders.    

 
(February 5, 2020); and Carbon and Alloy Steel Threaded Rod From India:  Amended Final Determination of Sales 
at Less Than Fair Value and Antidumping Duty Order, 85 FR 19925 (April 9, 2020) (collectively, Orders). 
2 See Initiation of Five-Year (Sunset) Reviews, 89 FR 87543 (November 4, 2024). 
3 See Domestic Interested Parties’ Letter, “Domestic Interested Parties’ Notification of Intent to Participate,” dated 
November 19, 2024. 
4 Id. 
5 See Commerce’s Letter, “Sunset Reviews Initiated on November 4, 2024,” dated November 25, 2024. 
6 See Domestic Interested Party’s Letters, “Five-Year (Sunset) Review of the Antidumping Duty Order on Carbon 
and Alloy Steel Threaded Rod from Taiwan – Petitioner’s Substantive Response to Notice of Initiation,” dated 
December 2, 2024; “Five-Year (Sunset) Review of the Antidumping Duty Order on Carbon and Alloy Steel 
Threaded Rod from Thailand – Petitioner’s Substantive Response to Notice of Initiation,” dated December 2, 2024; 
and “Five-Year (Sunset) Review of the Antidumping Duty Order on Carbon and Alloy Steel Threaded Rod from the 
Republic of India – Petitioner’s Substantive Response to Notice of Initiation,” dated December 2, 2024. 
7 See Commerce’s Letter, “Sunset Reviews Initiated on November 4, 2024,” dated December 26, 2024. 
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Scope of the Orders  

The product covered by these Orders is steel threaded rod from India, Taiwan, and 

Thailand.  For a full description of the scope, see the Issues and Decision Memorandum.8   

Analysis of Comments Received  

A complete discussion of all issues raised in these sunset reviews, including the 

likelihood of continuation or recurrence of dumping and the magnitude of the margins of 

dumping likely to prevail, is contained in the Issues and Decision Memorandum.9  A list of topics 

discussed in the Issues and Decision Memorandum is included as an appendix to this notice.  The 

Issues and Decision Memorandum is a public document and is on file electronically via 

Enforcement and Compliance’s Antidumping and Countervailing Duty Centralized Electronic 

Service System (ACCESS).  ACCESS is available to registered users at http://access.trade.gov.  

In addition, a complete version of the Issues and Decision Memorandum can be directly accessed 

at http://access.trade.gov/public/FRNoticesListLayout.aspx.    

Final Results of Sunset Reviews  

   Pursuant to sections 751(c)(1), and 752(c)(1) and (3) of the Act, Commerce determines 

that revocation of the Orders would be likely to lead to the continuation or recurrence of 

dumping and that the magnitude of dumping likely to prevail would be margins up to 28.34 

percent for India, up to 32.26 percent for Taiwan, and up to 20.83 percent for Thailand.10 

 
8 See Memorandum, “Issues and Decision Memorandum for the Final Results of the Expedited Sunset Reviews on 
Carbon and Alloy Steel Threaded Rod Steel Threaded Rod from India, Taiwan, and Thailand,” dated concurrently 
with, and hereby adopted by, this notice (Issues and Decision Memorandum).  
9 Id. 
10 See Orders. 
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Administrative Protective Order (APO)  

This notice serves as the only reminder to interested parties subject to an APO of their 

responsibility concerning the return/destruction or conversion to judicial protective order of 

proprietary information disclosed under APO in accordance with 19 CFR 351.305.  Timely 

notification of the return or destruction of APO materials or conversion to judicial protective 

order is hereby requested.  Failure to comply with the regulations and terms of an APO is a 

violation which is subject to sanction.  

Notification to Interested Parties  

  We are issuing and publishing these final results in accordance with sections 751(c), 

752(c), and 777(i)(1) of the Act, and 19 CFR 351.221(c)(5)(ii).   

Dated:  March 4, 2025. 

/S/ Christopher Abbott 
______________________   
Christopher Abbott, 
Deputy Assistant Secretary 
  for Policy and Negotiations, 
  performing the non-exclusive functions and duties 
  of the Assistant Secretary for Enforcement and Compliance. 
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Appendix 
 

List of Topics Discussed in the Issues and Decision Memorandum  
  

I. Summary  
II. Background  
III. Scope of the Orders  
IV. History of the Orders  
V. Legal Framework 
VI. Discussion of the Issues  

1. Likelihood of Continuation or Recurrence of Dumping 
2. Magnitude of the Margins of Dumping Likely to Prevail 

VII. Final Results of Sunset Reviews 
VIII. Recommendation  
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1 A record of the Commissioners’ votes, the 
Commission’s statement on adequacy, and any 
individual Commissioner’s statements will be 
available from the Office of the Secretary and at the 
Commission’s website. 

2 The Commission has found the response 
submitted on behalf of Bay Standard Manufacturing 
Inc. and Vulcan Threaded Products Manufacturing 
to be adequate. Comments from other interested 
parties will not be accepted (see 19 CFR 
207.62(d)(2)). 

INTERNATIONAL TRADE 
COMMISSION 

[Investigation Nos. 701–TA–618–619 and 
731–TA–1441–1444 (Review)] 

Carbon and Alloy Steel Threaded Rod 
From China, India, Taiwan, and 
Thailand; Scheduling of Expedited 
Five-Year Reviews 

AGENCY: United States International 
Trade Commission. 
ACTION: Notice. 

SUMMARY: The Commission hereby gives 
notice of the scheduling of expedited 
reviews pursuant to the Tariff Act of 
1930 (‘‘the Act’’) to determine whether 
revocation of the antidumping duty and 
countervailing duty orders on carbon 
and alloy steel threaded rod from China, 
India, Taiwan, and Thailand would be 
likely to lead to continuation or 
recurrence of material injury within a 
reasonably foreseeable time. 
DATES: February 4, 2025. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Jesse Sanchez (202) 205–2402, Office of 
Investigations, U.S. International Trade 
Commission, 500 E Street SW, 
Washington, DC 20436. Hearing- 
impaired persons can obtain 
information on this matter by contacting 
the Commission’s TDD terminal on 202– 
205–1810. Persons with mobility 
impairments who will need special 
assistance in gaining access to the 
Commission should contact the Office 
of the Secretary at 202–205–2000. 
General information concerning the 
Commission may also be obtained by 
accessing its internet server (https://
www.usitc.gov). The public record for 
this proceeding may be viewed on the 
Commission’s electronic docket (EDIS) 
at https://edis.usitc.gov. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 

Background.—On February 4, 2025, 
the Commission determined that the 
domestic interested party group 
response to its notice of institution (89 
FR 87409, November 1, 2024) of the 
subject five-year reviews was adequate 
and that the respondent interested party 
group response was inadequate. The 
Commission did not find any other 
circumstances that would warrant 
conducting full reviews.1 Accordingly, 
the Commission determined that it 
would conduct expedited reviews 
pursuant to section 751(c)(3) of the Act 
(19 U.S.C. 1675(c)(3)). 

For further information concerning 
the conduct of these reviews and rules 

of general application, consult the 
Commission’s Rules of Practice and 
Procedure, part 201, subparts A and B 
(19 CFR part 201), and part 207, 
subparts A, D, E, and F (19 CFR part 
207). 

Staff report.—A staff report containing 
information concerning the subject 
matter of the reviews has been placed in 
the nonpublic record, and will be made 
available to persons on the 
Administrative Protective Order service 
list for these reviews on May 14, 2025. 
A public version will be issued 
thereafter, pursuant to § 207.62(d)(4) of 
the Commission’s rules. 

Written submissions.—As provided in 
§ 207.62(d) of the Commission’s rules, 
interested parties that are parties to the 
reviews and that have provided 
individually adequate responses to the 
notice of institution,2 and any party 
other than an interested party to the 
reviews may file written comments with 
the Secretary on what determination the 
Commission should reach in the 
reviews. Comments are due on or before 
5:15 p.m. on May 22, 2025 and may not 
contain new factual information. Any 
person that is neither a party to the five- 
year reviews nor an interested party 
may submit a brief written statement 
(which shall not contain any new 
factual information) pertinent to the 
reviews by May 22, 2025. However, 
should the Department of Commerce 
(‘‘Commerce’’) extend the time limit for 
its completion of the final results of its 
reviews, the deadline for comments 
(which may not contain new factual 
information) on Commerce’s final 
results is three business days after the 
issuance of Commerce’s results. If 
comments contain business proprietary 
information (BPI), they must conform 
with the requirements of §§ 201.6, 
207.3, and 207.7 of the Commission’s 
rules. The Commission’s Handbook on 
Filing Procedures, available on the 
Commission’s website at https://
www.usitc.gov/documents/handbook_
on_filing_procedures.pdf, elaborates 
upon the Commission’s procedures with 
respect to filings. 

In accordance with §§ 201.16(c) and 
207.3 of the rules, each document filed 
by a party to the reviews must be served 
on all other parties to the reviews (as 
identified by either the public or BPI 
service list), and a certificate of service 
must be timely filed. The Secretary will 
not accept a document for filing without 
a certificate of service. 

Determination.—The Commission has 
determined these reviews are 
extraordinarily complicated and 
therefore has determined to exercise its 
authority to extend the review period by 
up to 90 days pursuant to 19 U.S.C. 
1675(c)(5)(B). 

Authority: These reviews are being 
conducted under authority of title VII of 
the Act; this notice is published 
pursuant to § 207.62 of the 
Commission’s rules. 

By order of the Commission. 
Issued: March 5, 2025. 

Lisa Barton, 
Secretary to the Commission. 
[FR Doc. 2025–03773 Filed 3–7–25; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 7020–02–P 

DEPARTMENT OF JUSTICE 

Drug Enforcement Administration 

[Docket No. DEA–1506] 

Importer of Controlled Substances 
Application: Stepan Company 

AGENCY: Drug Enforcement 
Administration, Justice. 
ACTION: Notice of application. 

SUMMARY: Stepan Company has applied 
to be registered as an importer of basic 
class(es) of controlled substance(s). 
Refer to SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION 
listed below for further drug 
information. 

DATES: Registered bulk manufacturers of 
the affected basic class(es), and 
applicants, therefore, may submit 
electronic comments on or objections to 
the issuance of the proposed registration 
on or before April 9, 2025. Such persons 
may also file a written request for a 
hearing on the application on or before 
April 9, 2025. 
ADDRESSES: The Drug Enforcement 
Administration requires that all 
comments be submitted electronically 
through the Federal eRulemaking Portal, 
which provides the ability to type short 
comments directly into the comment 
field on the web page or attach a file for 
lengthier comments. Please go to 
https://www.regulations.gov and follow 
the online instructions at that site for 
submitting comments. Upon submission 
of your comment, you will receive a 
Comment Tracking Number. Please be 
aware that submitted comments are not 
instantaneously available for public 
view on https://www.regulations.gov. If 
you have received a Comment Tracking 
Number, your comment has been 
successfully submitted and there is no 
need to resubmit the same comment. All 
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